Arlington Heights Park District

ARC Addition & Locker Room Renovation
Thursday, February 13, 2025, at 1:00 PM
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Trade Contractor Base Bid \7§ Y %/ Combination Bid Notes
Abbey Construction Co., Inc $ 211,500.00 || X | X | X | X
Boller Construction $ 255,000.00 | X | X | X | X
Eagle Concrete, Inc. $ 230,600.00 | X | X | X | X
Elliot Construction Corporation $ 218,000.00 || X | X |inc.| X
JB Concrete Contractor, Inc. No Bid
Manusos General Contracting, Inc. $ 192,000.00 || X [ X | X | X
Schaefges Brothers, Inc. $ 333,777.00 || X | X | X[ X
TOR Construction Company $ 276,600.00 |[1-3| X |inc.| X No Addendenum 4
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Thursday, February 13, 2025, at 1:00 PM

04A-1 Masonry
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Trade Contractor Base Bid SOLS &'<Y Combination Bid Notes
A-One Group Ltd. $ 144,800.00 [| X | X | X | X
Cyberdyne Masonry $ 142,908.00 || X | X |inc.| X
Ebben Masonry, Inc. $ 153,700.00 [|1-3] X | X | X No Addendenum 4
G.C. Masonry, Inc. $ 124,000.00 ||1-3] X | X | X No Addendenum 4
JAC Masonry, Inc. $ 149,600.00 [| X | X | X | X
Jimmy'z Masonry Corp $ 159,900.00 || X | X | X[ X
Mastership Construction Co, Inc. No Bid
Midwest Masonry, Inc. $ 158,700.00 || X | X |inc.| X
MPZ Masonry & Construction, Inc. $ 139,800.00 || X | X | X[ X
Piazza & Mannerino Masonry, Inc. $ 171,000.00 || X | X | X | X
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Trade Contractor Base Bid WY\ 2’ Combination Bid Notes
Barb City Steel Corp No Bid
Guardian Construction Products, Inc. No Bid
Jack Frost Ironworks $ 141,820.00 || X [ X | X | X
McKinney Steel & Sales, Inc. $ 157,125.00 || X [ X | X | X
S.G. Krauss Company No Bid
Steel Management Inc. $ 148,400.00 || X [ X |inc.| X
T.A. Bowman Constructors LLC $ 153,000.00 || X [ X [inc.| X
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O6A-1 General Trades
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Trade Contractor Base Bid Rough-In S \’50 Q\{'o Combination Bid Notes
Boller Construction $ 1,079,100.00 | $ 5,000.00 X| x| X
D Kersey Construction Co. $ 1,212,618.00 | $ 500.00 X | X[ X
Edwin Anderson Construction No Bid
Hargrave Builders $ 816,450.00 | $ 4,750.00 X | X[ X
Manusos General Contracting, Inc. $ 1,042,130.00 | $ - X| XX
TOR Construction Company No Bid
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Trade Contractor Base Bid e &< Combination Bid Notes
All American Exterior Solutions No Bid
Anthony Roofing Tecta America LLC $ 103,550.00 || X | X[ X[ X
Bennett & Brosseau Roofing Inc. No Bid
Combined Roofing Services, LLC No Bid
Elens & Maichin Roofing & Sheet Metal Inc. No Bid
G.E. Riddiford Company $ 143,200.00 [[1-3] X | X | X No Addendenum 4
J&F Chiattello Construction Inc $ 122,308.00 [[1-4] X | X | X No Addendenum 4
L. Marshall Roofing, Inc. $ 133,500.00 || X | X[ X[ X
SCR-Sterling Commercial Roofing $ 102,700.00 || X [ X | X | X
Weatherguard Roofing No Bid
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08B-1 Aluminum, Glass, and Glazing
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Trade Contractor Base Bid \7§ Y %/ Combination Bid Notes
3F Corporation $ 242,000.00 || X [ X | X[ X
Des Plaines Glass Company No Bid
Gateway Glazing, Inc. $ 230,000.00 || X [ X | X[ X
IG Commercial $ 299,600.00 || X | X | X | X
Krull Window Company, Inc. $ 369,873.00 || X | X | X | X
Reliant Contract Glass $ 233,700.00 | X | X | X | X
Rock Valley Glass, Inc. No Bid




Arlington Heights Park District

ARC Addition & Locker Room Renovation
Thursday, February 13, 2025, at 1:00 PM
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Walk-Off Carpet at Entry 111D and o &oe’ 2 OQ}‘\
Replacement at Lobby | Existing Lap/Diving éeob 2 OxQ" <<
Trade Contractor Base Bid 100 Pool Deck 131 & Q°° & Q\’0 Combination Bid Notes

Benchmark Flooring, Inc. $ 212,000.00 | $ 9,480.00 | $ 10,520.00 [| X | X | X | X

Boss Carpet One LLC $ 242,000.00 | $ 12,500.00 | $ 14,340.00 [| X | X | X | X

Commercial Carpet Consultants $ 266,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 23,000.00 || X[ X | X[ X

Douglas Commercial Flooring $ 264,311.00 | $ 15,311.00 | $ 15,900.00 || X | X | X [ X

Integral Flooring Systems No Bid

Libertyville Tile & Carpet $ 216,198.00 | $ 11,420.00 | $ 12,206.00 || X | X | X [ X

Noland Sales Corporation $ 227,000.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 8,300.00 || X | X | X | X

Pinnacle Flooring Company $ 265,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 13,000.00 || X | X |inc.| X

TSI Commercial Floor Covering, Inc. $ 267,278.00 | $ 11,653.00 | $ 9,525.00 [| X [ X | X[ X
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09G-1 Painting
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Trade Contractor Base Bid \7§ Y %/ Combination Bid Notes
Ascher Brothers Co., Inc $ 37,965.00 [| X | X [inc.| X
Cosgrove Construction, Inc. $ 38,300.00 [| X | X | X | X
International Decorators, Inc. No Bid
K & J Painting $ 47,698.00 || X | X[ X | X
Midwest Decorating $ 43,950.00 [| X | X | X [ X
MS Sebastian Painting Inc. $ 36,050.00 [| X | X | X [ X
Nedrow Decorating Inc. $ 34,600.00 || X | X | O X
Oosterbaan & Sons Co. $ 38,340.00 || X | X | X [ X
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21A-1 Fire Protection
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Trade Contractor Base Bid \7§> Y %/ Combination Bid Notes
Absolute Fire Protection, Inc. $ 45800.00 || X | X[ X | X
Automatic Fire Systems, Inc. $ 54,600.00 [| X | X | X | X
Nelson Fire Protection No Bid
No addenda
S.J. Carlson Fire Protection $ 41,165.00 || O | X l|inc.| X acknowledged




Arlington Heights Park District

ARC Addition & Locker Room Renovation

LAINVIP

INCORPORATED

A CONSTRUCTION TRADITION

Thursday, February 13, 2025, at 1:00 PM

22A-1 Plumbing
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Trade Contractor Base Bid \7§ Y %/ Combination Bid Notes
Abitua Sewer, Water & Plumbing, Inc. $ 288,556.00 X XX
C.R. Leonard Plumbing & Heating, Inc. No Bid
DeFranco Plumbing, Inc. $ 432,330.00 X XX
Great Lakes Plumbing & Heating Co./SPD No Bid
Hartwig Plumbing & Heating, Inc. $ 212,000.00 X[ X[ X
Helm Mechanical (FKA Mechanical Inc) No Bid
J.L. Wagner Plumbing & Piping, Inc. $ 205,900.00 X[ X[ X
Martin Petersen Company, Inc. No Bid
Sherman Mechanical, Inc. No Bid




Arlington Heights Park District
ARC Addition & Locker Room Renovation

LAM p Thursday, February 13, 2025, at 1:00 PM
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Trade Contractor Base Bid WY &< Combination Bid Notes

Accomplished Mechanical Industries, Ltd. No Bid
Amber Mechanical $ 494,500.00 || X [ X | X | X
C. Acitelli Heating & Piping Contractors, Inc. $ 443,000.00 [| X | X |inc.| X
Dekalb Mechanical, Inc. No Bid
F.E. Moran, Inc. $ 432,600.00 || X | X | X | X
Flo-Tech Mechanical Systems $ 444,000.00 || X [ X | X | X
Great Lakes Plumbing & Heating Co./SPD $ 434,000.00 [| X | X | X | X
Hartwig Plumbing & Heating, Inc. No Bid
Helm Mechanical $ 596,000.00 || X | X |INC| X
Jensen's Plumbing & Heating, Inc. $ 419,000.00 || X [ X | X | X
MG Mechanical Contracting, Inc. $ 442,000.00 ||1-3] X | X | X No Addendenum 4
Sherman Mechanical, Inc. $ 462,250.00 ||1-2] X | X | X No Addenda 3 or 4
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26A-1 Electrical
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Trade Contractor Base Bid Rough-In © Q-OQ \‘?}o Q\go Combination Bid Notes
Argon Electric Company, Inc. $ 223,000.00 | $ 18,300.00 || X | X | X | X
Ascend Electric $ 216,895.00 | $ 23,435.00 [| X [ X [ X | X
Bernardoni Electric, Inc. $ 218,300.00 | $ 25,000.00 [| X [ X [ X | X
J. Hamilton Electric Company $ 252,500.00 | $ 46,550.00 [| X | X | X | X
Kellenberger Electric, Inc. $ 256,483.00 | $ 26,306.00 || X [ X [ X | X
MK Industries, Inc. No Bid
Monarch Electric $ 239,900.00 | $ 67,000.00 || X | X [ X | X
Newcastle Electric Inc $ 220,000.00 | $ 39,000.00 || X [ X [ X | X
Peters Electric & Technology $ 266,400.00 | $ 22,470.00 || X [ X [ X | X
Prospect Electric Company $ 215,000.00 | $ 41,250.00 [| X | X | X | X
Ridgeview Electric, Inc. $ 223,800.00 | $ 27,500.00 [| X [ X | X | X
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\ oo e 31A-1 Excavation
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Trade Contractor Base Bid Rough-In e \‘?}o Q\go Combination Bid Notes

American Grading, Inc. No Bid
Fox Excavating Inc. $ 198,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 [| X | X | X | X
Kane County Excavating No Bid
Schaefges Brothers, Inc. No Bid
Stark & Son Trenching $ 129,129.00 | $ - X X| X[ X




